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Canadian Tire - Amherstburg
   
Exploring Canadian Tire in Amherstburg, Ontario

  Canadian Tire is a well-known department store that provides a wide range of
products to meet your household, automotive, and outdoor needs. Located
conveniently in Amherstburg, Ontario, this particular location offers various
services and features to enhance the shopping experience.  

Accessibility Features

  For visitors requiring mobility assistance, the **wheelchair-accessible car
park** and **wheelchair-accessible entrance** ensure that everyone can enjoy
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their shopping experience with ease. These thoughtful features reflect Canadian
Tire's commitment to accessibility for all customers.  

Payment Options Available

  When it comes to making purchases, Canadian Tire provides flexible payment
options. Customers can easily pay using **credit cards**, **debit cards**, and
even **NFC mobile payments**. This variety of payment methods makes
transactions quick and convenient, perfect for those looking for a **quick visit**. 

Product Selection and Service Options

  The Amherstburg Canadian Tire store stocks a bit of everything—automotive
supplies, kitchenware, and sports equipment, although some customers have
noted that the selection can be somewhat limited compared to larger locations.
While prices are generally reasonable, shoppers may find that certain products
have been damaged or are out of stock.   Service options include **in-store
pick-up** and **delivery**, which allows for a seamless shopping experience.
However, it's worth noting that curbside pickup has received mixed reviews, with
some customers expressing frustration about long wait times.  

Customer Experience

  Feedback from customers presents a mixed bag of experiences. Many have
praised the **friendly staff** who are always willing to help, especially when
locating specific items such as **batteries** or tools. For instance, one shopper
highlighted how an employee took the time to find the correct brake size for their
vehicle, showcasing the helpfulness of staff at this store.  Conversely, there
have been concerns regarding customer service, particularly in the automotive
service department. Some patrons reported dissatisfaction with the handling of
car repairs, indicating instances where communication was lacking, leading to
frustration over costs and service quality.   

Environmental Initiatives

  Canadian Tire also promotes sustainable practices like **recycling** and
encourages customers to participate in eco-friendly initiatives. This commitment
is not just evident in their product offerings but also in their approach to service
and community engagement.  

Conclusion

  Overall, Canadian Tire in Amherstburg stands out for its accessibility and
variety of products. While customer experiences vary, the store remains a
convenient option for many residents seeking both everyday essentials and
specialized items. With ongoing improvements in customer service and product
availability, Canadian Tire continues to strive for excellence in meeting
community needs.   
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The business is situated at

  
 380 Sandwich St S, N9V 3B5  Amherstburg, Ontario - Canada  (CA) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of the mentioned Department store  is +1519-736-6411
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1519-736-6411
 
    
 
   
    
 

We are available at these times:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–5?PM   Tuesday 8?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 8?AM–8?PM   Thursday 8?AM–8?PM   Friday 8?AM–8?PM   Saturday 8?AM–8?PM   Sunday 8?AM–6?PM        The website is Canadian Tire       If necessary to change any detail that you believe is not accurate concerning
this portal, we kindly request send a message and we will handle it as soon as
possible. In advance we appreciate it. 
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