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Les revêtements A. Théodore inc. - Ange-Gardien
   
Exploring Les revêtements A. Théodore Inc.: A Leading Siding Contractor
in Ange-Gardien, Quebec

  Les revêtements A. Théodore Inc. stands out as a reputable siding contractor
located in the picturesque village of Ange-Gardien, Quebec. Known for their
commitment to quality and customer satisfaction, Théodore Inc. has garnered a
mix of feedback from its clientele, highlighting both strengths and areas for
improvement.  
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Customer Experience: Praise and Concerns

  Many customers have praised the **excellent service** provided by Les
revêtements A. Théodore Inc. Communication was noted to be seamless,
making the process easier for homeowners seeking siding solutions. For
instance, one satisfied client remarked, "The work was done well and quickly,"
emphasizing not only the speed but also the quality of the job. The team’s
friendly demeanor further contributed to a positive experience for clients
entrusting them with their home improvement projects.  However, some reviews
raised concerns regarding safety protocols. A comment pointed out that the
team travels between red zones without adhering to necessary health
guidelines, such as wearing masks or maintaining safe distances between
employees. This aspect has drawn criticism and calls for better adherence to
safety regulations, especially in times when public health is a priority.  

Accessibility and Friendly Service

  One notable feature of Les revêtements A. Théodore Inc. is their
**wheelchair-accessible car park**, ensuring that all clients can access their
services without hassle. Accessibility remains a vital consideration in today’s
service-oriented landscape, and this thoughtful addition makes the company
stand out.   Clients often remark on the company's **super friendly service**,
further enhancing the overall customer experience. With speed of execution
being a recurring theme in reviews, it’s evident that Les revêtements A.
Théodore Inc. values timely and efficient work alongside quality craftsmanship.  

Quality of Work and Environmental Considerations

  The **quality of work** performed by Les revêtements A. Théodore Inc. is
frequently highlighted, with many customers expressing their satisfaction with
the materials and professionalism of the contractors. Yet, amidst the accolades,
there are voices of discontent regarding environmental considerations. Some
clients have expressed that the company seems indifferent to the work
environment, suggesting that potential customers should be cautious.  In
conclusion, while Les revêtements A. Théodore Inc. shines in terms of customer
service, speed, and quality work, there are vital aspects like safety protocols
and environmental responsibility that require attention. As they continue serving
the community of Ange-Gardien, balancing excellence in service with a
commitment to safe and responsible practices will be essential for sustaining
their reputation as a leading siding contractor in the region.    
You will find us at

  
 84 Rue Roy, J0E 1E0  Ange-Gardien, Quebec - Canada  (CA) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of the respective Siding contractor  is +1438-888-2760
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=45.3587996%2C-72.9350784#map=15/45.3587996/-72.9350784
tel:+1438-888-2760


And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+1438-888-2760
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our business hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 8:30?AM–12?PM   Tuesday Closed   Wednesday Closed   Thursday 8:30?AM–4:30?PM   Friday 8:30?AM–4:30?PM   Saturday 8:30?AM–4:30?PM   Sunday 8:30?AM–4:30?PM           If you need to modify any information that you believe is not accurate
concerning this site, we kindly request send a message so that we will fix it as
soon as possible. Thanks beforehand thanks. 
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Les revetements a theodore inc map

Les revetements a theodore inc by owner
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